

G-02-18
ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

Item	Description	Sierra	Quantity	Empire	Quantity	Carefree	Qty	Pollock	Qty	Tera	Qty	Baxter	American Pride	All American Poly
Flat Mop heads	24 oz. Cotton, Screw-type	\$4.39	ea	\$5.15	ea	\$4.37		\$6.24		\$5.98			No Bid	No Bid
Mop Handles	60 in. Wood twister mop handles	\$5.25	ea	\$4.52	ea	\$4.70		\$3.99		\$4.84			No Bid	No Bid
Mop Handles	52 in. Steel Quick Connect 6/cs.	\$5.75	ea	\$6.59	ea	\$34.05	6 caase	\$5.93	ea	\$41.70	6/case		No Bid	No Bid
Mop Handles	60 in. Steel Quick Connect 6/cs.	\$7.65	ea	\$9.24	ea	\$43.73		\$6.33		\$10.07			No Bid	No Bid
Mop Pad Holder	18 in. Quick Connect, Wet Dry Frame	\$6.88	ea	\$11.59	ea	\$16.75		\$16.56		\$23.33			No Bid	No Bid
Push Brooms	24 in. Milwaukee, Meet or Exceed, Medium Duty, wood	\$13.95	ea	\$8.79	ea	\$13.45		\$8.94		\$11.08			No Bid	No Bid
Push Broom Handles	Wood, Screw-on to fit above	\$3.89	ea	\$3.63	ea	\$3.15		\$2.62		\$2.40			No Bid	No Bid
Ladies Kitchen Broom	22 lb. Metal Handle, 26 lb. Straw Broom	\$5.92	ea	\$5.61	ea	\$5.75		\$5.49		\$8.14			No Bid	No Bid
Bowl Brushes	9 in. Plastic Rubbermaid 6310 or equal	\$2.89	ea	\$2.49	ea	\$2.80		\$1.67		\$1.69			No Bid	No Bid
Bowl Brushes	4.5 in. strands of acid resistant 12in plastic handle	\$5.59	ea	\$0.68	ea	\$1.00		\$1.00		\$2.87			No Bid	No Bid
Hand Soap	27 fl. oz., 12/case	\$27.91	cs	\$37.55	cs	\$26.60		\$26.59		\$30.32			No Bid	No Bid
Pumice Bar Soap	4 oz. bars, 48 bars/case	\$44.98	cs	\$40.55	cs	\$42.00		\$42.13		\$38.57			No Bid	No Bid
Hand Sanitizer	Hospital Grade, Fresh Scent, Fights Pseudomonas, Influenza, Herpes, and effective against HIV-1, Salmonella & Staphylococcus. 1-2 oz. dilution Ratio Virucidal, No Rinse, No dulling Dilution Ratio _____oz. _____per case	\$26.91	cs	\$70.71	cs	\$44.59		No Bid		\$36.30			No Bid	No Bid
Multi-purpose Cleaner	All surface cleaner Fresh scent 12/case	\$26.45	cs	\$26.99	cs	\$38.35		\$26.74		\$38.61			No Bid	No Bid
Hand Sanitizer	2/4 oz. bottles			\$40.58	4 oz cs	\$49.11	2 oz case	\$37.99	2 oz case	\$18.34	2 oz case		No Bid	No Bid
Hand Sanitizer	8 oz. bottles	\$2.45	ea	\$39.48	cs	\$47.25		\$40.54		\$23.06			No Bid	No Bid
Hand Sanitizer	16 oz. bottles	\$6.95	ea	\$52.16	cs	\$52.15				\$28.93			No Bid	No Bid
Floor Finish	Acrylic Floor Finish, 2500 sq. ft. coverage area, respond to high speed floor machine, detergent resistant, buffable high gloss, 5 gal	\$64.25	cs	\$53.16	cs	\$64.22		\$53.50		\$66.90			No Bid	No Bid
Wax Sealer	Seal Coat, polymer emulsion, seals and reconditions resilient tile flooring, resist water marks and scuffs. To be used on all types of floors. 3,000 sq. ft. coverage per gal. Industrial and institutional grade	\$85.22	cs	\$56.21	cs	\$73.69		\$64.71		\$72.52			No Bid	No Bid
Stripper	Non- ammoniated 5 gal/pail	\$55.60	pl	\$29.20	pl	\$50.02				\$36.98			No Bid	No Bid
Stripper	Ammoniated 5 gal/pail			\$42.40	pl	\$60.00		\$49.56		\$62.16			No Bid	No Bid
Bagged Liquid Hand Soap	27 oz. Pump dispensers	\$15.46	ea			\$26.60		No Bid		\$47.53			No Bid	No Bid

**G-02-18
ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR JANITORIAL SUPPLIES**

Air Freshener	20 oz. cans Fresh scent _____ Cans per case	\$27.76	cs	\$28.21	cs	\$41.78		\$31.15		\$62.40			No Bid	No Bid
Spray Disinfectant	Lysol Spray Disinfectant cans 1LB .5oz size or equal 12 cans per case	\$25.99	cs	\$34.96	cs	\$73.22		\$82.02		\$45.20			No Bid	No Bid
Laundry Detergent	Powdered, 50 lb., preferred ___lb. per container	\$23.76	50 lb ct	\$19.19	40 lb cs	\$30.70	50 lbs	\$20.56	40 lb	\$29.65	40 lb		No Bid	No Bid
Liquid Bleach	USDA Approved 4 gal/case									\$7.65			No Bid	No Bid
Liquid Bleach	6 gal/case	\$10.58	cs	\$11.19	cs	\$9.25		\$9.94		\$15.40			No Bid	No Bid
Abrasive Cleaner	___ oz. size or equal ___ cans per case	\$28.78	cs	\$23.38	cs	\$22.93		\$25.00		No Bid			No Bid	No Bid
Trash Can Liners	15x9x32, .04 mil,7-10 gal _____ count	\$27.93	1000 ct	\$15.15	500 ct	\$24.88	1,000 ct	\$27.38	1000 ct	\$17.74	500 ct		No Bid	26.02 500 ct.
Trash Can Liners	23x17x46, .70 mil 40-45 gal _____ count	\$12.86	125 ct	\$12.64	100 ct	\$18.00	100 ct	\$29.75	250 ct	\$15.12	100 ct		No Bid	18.69 150 ct.
Trash Can Liners	22x16x58, 1.5 mil 55 gal, _____ count	\$20.49	100 ct			\$24.00		\$30.46	100 ct	\$21.22	25 ct		No Bid	17.83 100 ct.
Trash Can Liners	L 38x58	\$25.10	200 ct	\$22.26	cs	\$15.32		No Bid		\$18.72			No Bid	\$17.83
Trash Can Liners	SM 24x33	\$16.98	1000 ct	\$19.08	cs	\$25.84		No Bid		\$17.88			No Bid	\$26.83
Paper Towels	12 Rolls / Case	\$16.55	cs	\$18.52	cs	\$18.00		\$20.88		\$5.99			No Bid	No Bid
Paper Towels	Brown Roll 16 roll/cs,350',8" wide, 2" diameter	\$16.55	cs	\$16.99	cs	\$18.00		\$17.65		\$20.20			\$20.76	No Bid
Tri-fold Paper Towels	Brown 16 Package Roll	\$15.75	cs	\$15.04	cs	\$16.87		\$16.29		\$17.69			\$20.98	No Bid
Tri-fold Paper Towels	White	\$18.39	cs	\$17.80	cs	\$18.68		\$17.94		\$19.50			\$20.98	No Bid
Paper Towel Dispenser	For Towels listed above	\$15.95	ea	\$22.95	ea	\$20.00		No Bid		\$25.07			No Bid	No Bid
Multi-fold Paper towels	4000 embossed, 9.25in x 9.5in 3 fold, 16 pkgs. per case	\$15.75	cs	\$39.74	cs	\$16.87		\$19.53		\$27.50			\$20.98	No Bid
Multi-fold paper towel dispenser	To fit towels listed above	\$15.95	ea			\$30.00		\$23.86		\$20.65			No Bid	No Bid
Small Roll Toilet Tissue	sheets per roll, 2 ply, white rolls per case	\$27.91	500/95 cs	\$30.53	500/96 cs	\$29.00	500/96 cs	\$34.71	500/80 cs	\$31.68	2/96 cs		\$36.98 500/96	No Bid
Toilet Tissue Dispenser	For paper listed above	\$9.94	ea			\$10.00				\$10.25			No Bid	No Bid
Jumbo Toilet Tissue	___ ft. per roll, 2 ply, white, ___ rolls per case	\$21.92	cs	\$20.54	1000/12 cs	\$24.00	1000/12 ca	\$20.78	850/12 case	\$19.97	700/12 cs		\$20.94 1,000/12	No Bid
Coreless Toilet Paper	White, 2-ply	\$25.99	cs	\$43.90	cs	\$62.00		\$33.71		\$54.67			No Bid	No Bid
Jumbo Toilet Tissue Dispenser	For paper listed above	\$24.70	ea	\$21.92	ea	\$30.00		No Bid		\$18.99			No Bid	No Bid
Styrofoam cups	6oz hot/cold per case	\$18.99	cs	\$17.46	cs	\$18.35		\$17.20		\$23.01			No Bid	No Bid
Styrofoam cups	8 oz. hot/cold 1000 per case	\$21.78	cs	\$20.09	cs	\$21.48		\$20.12		\$25.25			No Bid	No Bid
Styrofoam cups	16 oz. hot/cold 500 per case	\$45.54	cs	\$41.83	cs	\$44.00		\$41.21		\$42.12			No Bid	No Bid
Spray Buff	Quart size			\$21.20	ea	\$34.68		\$25.55		\$40.48			No Bid	No Bid
Spray Buff	Gallon size	\$39.90	ea	\$23.18	ea	\$32.41		\$32.32		\$24.61			No Bid	No Bid
Buffer Pads	20 in. , 5 per case	\$15.72	cs	\$13.38	cs	\$17.00		\$13.33		\$17.82			No Bid	No Bid
Polishing Pads	20 in. White, 5/case	\$15.72	cs	\$13.38	cs	\$17.00		\$13.33		\$25.76			No Bid	No Bid
Stripping Pads	20 in. Black, 5/case	\$15.72	cs	\$13.38	cs	\$17.00		\$13.33		\$17.94			No Bid	No Bid

**G-02-18
ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR JANITORIAL SUPPLIES**

Mopping Pads	18 in. Blue Microfiber, 12/cs.	\$3.49	ea	\$85.29	ea	\$35.00		\$3.09	6.18 case	\$69.80			No Bid	No Bid
Stainless Steel Cleaner/Polish	15 oz. Spray can, odorless, non-oily per case	\$41.20	cs	\$32.45	cs	\$25.35		\$35.34		\$31.65			No Bid	No Bid
Furniture Polish	Cleaner & wax _____ ounces per case	\$28.99	17 oz/12 cs	\$33.78	19 oz/cs	\$36.98	20 oz/case	\$36.69	20 oz/case	\$37.71			No Bid	No Bid
Glass Cleaner	4 gal/case	\$21.29	cs	\$15.26		\$22.65		\$17.61		\$11.99			No Bid	No Bid
Disinfectant spray	12 cans per case _ ounces Per cans	\$25.99	17 oz cs	\$36.04	15.5 oz	\$24.71	20 oz	\$40.76	16 oz	\$38.73	7 oz		No Bid	No Bid
Disinfectant wipes	75/ct.	\$25.67	ct	\$25.60		\$22.75		\$50.54		\$25.90			No Bid	No Bid
Latex Gloves (Must be 6 mil thickness, must meet FDA standards)	Non-powdered 100/bx.-small	\$38.90	bx	\$43.60	bx	\$50.00		\$33.33		\$11.50			\$31.54	No Bid
Latex Gloves (Must be 6 mil thickness, must meet FDA standards)	Non-powdered 100/bx.-med	\$38.90	bx	\$43.60	bx	\$50.00		\$33.33		\$11.50			\$31.54	No Bid
Latex Gloves (Must be 6 mil thickness, must meet FDA standards)	Non-powdered 100/bx.-large	\$38.90	bx	\$43.60	bx	\$50.00		\$33.33		\$11.50			\$31.54	No Bid
TOTAL		\$1,300.62		\$1,504.39		\$1,803.03		\$1,322.55		\$1,602.73				
Percentage (%) discount will be given on any item not listed on this bid		20%		0%		20%		25-40% Off TASB Buyboard Pricing		30%			0%	10%

Location		Tyler, TX		Wichita Falls, TX		Bossier City, LA		Grand Prairie, TX		Hicksville, NY		Tyler, TX	Lakewood, NJ	Piscataway, NJ
-----------------	--	-----------	--	-------------------	--	------------------	--	-------------------	--	----------------	--	-----------	--------------	----------------

# Items No Bid		4		4		1		10		1				
Delivery Sched. - Turnaround Times		Daily - Local warehouse		Daily for Tyler; 3/wk for Winona, 1/wk for Whitehouse & Bullard		1/week deliveries		Generally 1/week - priority items could be delivered within 2 days if in stock						
Awarded Vendor(s)														
Primary		Sierra Packaging 14174 SH 31 West PO Box 1619 Tyler, TX 75709 903-534-8875 Christie Johnson invoices@sierrapackaging.net												

**Bid
Rejected -
Incomplete**
54 57